
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y  
2700 Ogden Avenue │Downers Grove, IL  60515 │ Phone: 630.241.6800 │TTY: 630.241.6988 

www.illinoistollway.com 
 
 

` 

BID OPENING RESULTS 
 

IFB 
18-0103R GUARDRAIL PARTS 

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 22, 2019 10:30 AM 
19-557THA-PROCU-B-7026 

VENDOR: INDUSTRIAL FENCE ELECTRONIC (Y/N) YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 $895,624.70 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $1,856,879.55 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $5,494,558.75 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 $48,730.60 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 5 $4,743,658.65 YES 

  

VENDOR: CSD ENVIRONMENTAL SVC., INC. ELECTRONIC (Y/N)  YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 $1,268,501.00 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $2,144,687.20 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $ NO BID YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 $ NO BID YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 5 $ NO BID YES 
 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
 

IFB 
18-0103R GUARDRAIL PARTS 

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 22, 2019 10:30 AM 
19-557THA-PROCU-B-7026 

 

VENDOR: ALFREDO IRON WORKS, INC. ELECTRONIC (Y/N) YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 $922,845.40 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $1,886,169.15 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $7,218,943.65 YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 $ NO BID YES 

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 5 $4,866,811.65 YES 
 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y  
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BID OPENING RESULTS 

IFB  
17-0208RR Wood Sign Posts 

 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

1. Kankakee Ace Hardware $37,028.00 

2. Tiles In Style LLC $54,117.50 

3. FGR Electrical Control & LLC $61,959.00 

4. CSD Environmental Svcs. Inc. $70,486.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 

I L L I N O I S  T O L L W A Y  
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BID OPENING RESULTS 

IFB  
17-0208RR Wood Sign Posts 

 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

1. Kankakee Ace Hardware 
Paper Copy   Electronis Copy 

$37,028.00 

2. Tiles In Style LLC 
Paper Copy   Electronis Copy 

$54,117.50 

3. FGR Electrical Control & LLC 
Paper Copy   Electronis Copy 

$61,959.00 

4. CSD Environmental Svcs. Inc. 
Paper Copy   Electronis Copy 

$70,486.00 

 
 

 


