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BID Results
IFB
12~0192 Copier and Production Printer Equipment
Friday, September 6, 2013 Room 320 Time: 10:30 a.m.

Xerox Corporation

$1,087,631.60 | $1,188,576.20 |$22,113.00

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical
errors.
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BID Results
Invitation for Bid
IFB
12~0063 Preventative Maintenance and Repair of Boiler
and
Hot Water Heaters

Thursday, September 19, 2013 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 215

1) Group 1 Total $ 14,800.00
2) Group 2 Total $815
3) Group 3 Total $19,800.00
4) Group 4 Total $34,200.00
Grand Total (total of lines 1 thru 4 above) $69,615.00

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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BID Results
Invitation for Bid
IFB
13-0077 Elevator Maintenance Inspection Repair
and
Full Hydraulic Pressure Testing

Thursday, September 19, 2013 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 215

Total Group 1 — Elevator Maintenance Inspection $21,600.00
Total Group 2 — Hydraulic Pressure Testing $10,440.00
Total Group 3 — Parts Percent Discount or Mark Up-~ | $39,240.00
Total Group 4 Hourly Rate $26,484.00
Total Bid | 97,764.00

Total Group 1 — Elevator Maintenance Inspection $15,720.00
Total Group 2 — Hydraulic Pressure Testing $ 87,750.00
Total Group 3 — Parts Percent Discount or Mark Up- | $42,750.00
Total Group 4 Hourly Rate $42,660.00
Total Bid | $188,880.00

Total Group 1 — Elevator Maintenance Inspection $41,064.00
Total Group 2 — Hydraulic Pressure Testing $ 75,777.00
Total Group 3 — Hourly Rate $ 27,036.00

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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Total Group 1 — Elevator Maintenance Inspection $21,600.00
Total Group 2 — Hydraulic Pressure Testing $14,210.00
Total Group 3 — Parts Percent Discount or Mark Up-~ | $36,900.00
Total Group 4 Hourly Rate $28,151.16

Total Bid | 100,861.16

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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13-0086 Off Road Equipment

BID Results
Invitation for Bid

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority
2700 Ogden Avenue

Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-~1703
630/241-6800

630/241-6100 Fax

630/241-6898 TTY

1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions
www.illinoistollway.com

Thursday, September 19, 2013 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room 215

Total Bid Line 1

No Bid

Total Bid Line 2

No Bid

Total Bid Line 3

$25,278.00

Total Bid Line 4

$12,942.00

Total Bid Line 5

$6,511.00

Total Bid Line 6

$4,867.00

Total Bid Line 7

$5,386.00

Total Bid Line 8

$4,443.00

Total Bid Line 1 | $226,080.00
Total Bid Line 2 | $179,450.00
Total Bid Line 3 | $24,400.00
Total Bid Line 4 | $11,970.00
Total Bid Line 5 | $5,990.00
Total Bid Line 6 | $4,570.00
Total Bid Line 7 | $5,980.00
Total Bid Line 8 | $3,990.00

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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Total Bid Line 1 | $289,600.00
Total Bid Line 2 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 3 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 4 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 5 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 6 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 7 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 8 | No Bid

Total Bid Line 1 | N/A

Total Bid Line 2 | $228,225.00
Total Bid Line 3 | $30,148.00
Total Bid Line 4 | $12,008.00
Total Bid Line 5 | $7,160.000
Total Bid Line 6 | $3,174.00
Total Bid Line 7 | $8,146.00
Total Bid Line 8 | $4,725.00

Total Bid Line 1 | $235,928.00
Total Bid Line 2 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 3 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 4 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 5 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 6 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 7 | No Bid
Total Bid Line 8 | No Bid

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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Total Bid Line 1 | $290,852.00
Total Bid Line 2 | $217,850.00
Total Bid Line 3 | $29,930.00
Total Bid Line 4 | $13,725.00
Total Bid Line 5 | $6,995.00
Total Bid Line 6 | $5,250.00
Total Bid Line 7 | $6,410.00
Total Bid Line 8 | $4,685.00

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical errors.
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BID Results
IFB
13~-0034 Purchase of Allison Transmission Repair and Parts
Wednesday, September 25, 2013 Room 340 Time: 10:30 a.m.

Inland Power Group

$179,142.98

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical
errors.
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BID Proposals
Request for Information
(RFP)
13~0008RR E-Recruiting Software and Support
Friday, September 27, 2013 Room 207 Time: 10:30 a.m.

1. Winvale Group

2. Interview Exchange

3. GovernmentJobs.com, Inc. (d/b/a) NEOGOV)

4. SuccessFactors, Inc.

5. Universal Consulting Partners, Inc.

6. Harrison Street Real Estate
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