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IFB
Contract#21-0172RR/Professional Painting Supplies

Due Date: November 17,2023
Time: 10:30 a.m.

NO BIDS

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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#23-0147 Tripwire Software Maintenance and Support B-39301

Due Date: Thursday, November 16, 2023

Time: 10:30am

Savvy Technology Solutions, LLC $638,893.85
SHI International Corp. $637,299.92
VPrime Tech, Inc. $619,514.50

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Contract#/Description: 23-0116 Job Order Contracting for Roadway Services

Due Date: 11/9/2023
Time: 11:00 a.m.

Leopardo Companies

Zonel $2,924,812.50
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $974,937.50
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $974,937.50
Zone 2 $2,924,812.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $974,937.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $974,937.50
Zone 3 $2,924,812.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $974,937.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $974,937.50
Zone 4 $2,924,812.50

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Zone 4 Renewal Year 1

$974,937.50

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2

$974,937.50

F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen & Associates LLC

Zone 1 $3,097,612.50
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,032,537.50
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,032,537.50
Zone 2 $3,097,612.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,032,537.50
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,032,537.50
Zone 3 $3,097,612.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,032,537.50
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,032,537.50
Zone 4 $3,097,612.50
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,032,537.50
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,032,537.50

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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PLOTE CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Zone 1 No Bid
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 No Bid
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 No Bid
Zone 2 No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 No Bid
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 No Bid
Zone 3 No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 No Bid
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 No Bid
Zone 4 $3,483,750.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,137,500.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,137,500.00

Foundation Mechanics LLC

Zone 1 $4,743,750.00

Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,581,250.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,581,250.00
Zone 2 $4,653,750.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,551,250.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,551,250.00
Zone 3 $4,653,750.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,551,250.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,551,250.00
Zone 4 $4,743,750.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,581,250.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,581,250.00
Robe, Inc.
Zone 1l $3,450,000.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $1,150,000.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $1,150,000.00
Zone 2 $3,450,000.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $1,150,000.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $1,150,000.00

Zone 3 $3,450,000.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $1,150,000.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $1,150,000.00

Zone 4 $3,450,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $1,150,000.00
Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $1,150,000.00

McDonagh Demolition

Zone 1l $2,733,750.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 1 $911,250.00
Zone 1 Renewal Year 2 $911,250.00

Zone 2 $2,998,125.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 1 $999,375.00
Zone 2 Renewal Year 2 $999,375.00

Zone 3 $2,733,750.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 1 $911,250.00
Zone 3 Renewal Year 2 $911,250.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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Zone 4 $2,791,687.50

Zone 4 Renewal Year 1 $930,562.50

Zone 4 Renewal Year 2 $930,562.50

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.
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23-0131-~ Red Hat Software Maintenance and Support

Wednesday, November 8, 2023, 10:00a.m.

SHI International Corp. $2,526,876.82
Acachi LLC $1,520,246.37
V3Main Technologies, Inc. $1,519,508.66
NVS Consulting $1,475,967.86
vPrime Tech Inc $1,663,283.39
Emergent, LLC $2,176,260.32

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY

2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988
www.illinoistollway.com


http://www.illinoistollway.com/

	23-0147_Bid Results Website_Tripwire
	23-0116 IFB Bid opening sheet  JOC Roadway Services for Website 1
	23-0131_Bid Results_11082023

