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Hlinois

LEI[ way

BID OPENING RESULTS
IFB

Contract#/Description: 22-0006RRR Lumber and Plywood

Due Date: 8/31/2022
Time: 10:30 a.m.

KANKAKEE ACE HARDWARE

$111,041.25

Sykesmore LLC

$123,542.75

TILES IN STYLE

$222,596.00

Occupational Training & Supply, Inc.

$139,032.00

Interior Design by A. Valentine DBA Valentine, Alicia

$233,465.00

KANKAKEE ACE HARDWARE

$113,440.45

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY

2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988

www.illinoistollway.com
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LEI[ way

BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
Contract#22-0066/Leica Scanners and Software

Due Date: August 26, 2022
Time: 10:30 a.m. CT

Collision Forensic Solutions $424,655.25

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY
2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988
www.illinoistollway.com
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BID OPENING RESULTS
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Contract#/Description: 21-0205 Fire Alarm Inspections and Repairs

Due Date: 8/10/2022
Time: 10:30 a.m.

RELIABLE FIRE EQUIPMENT CO $1,512,043.33

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY
2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 |TTY: 630.241.6988
www.illinoistollway.com
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BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
Contract#/Description #21-0172R Professional Painting Supplies

Due Date: Friday, August 12, 2022
Time: 10:30a.m. CDT

No Bids

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY
2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988
www.illinoistollway.com
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BID OPENING RESULTS

IFB
Contract#/Description:21-0068 Job Order Contracting (JOC) for Roadway

Due Date: Tuesday, August 16, 2022

Time: 10:30a.m. CT

F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen & Associates
LLC

$15,262,500.00

$15,262,500.00

$15,262,500.00

$15,262,500.00

Leopardo Companies

$21,169,500.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Foundation Mechanics LLC

No Bid

$21,955,600.00

No Bid

No Bid

McDonagh Demolition

$12,531,750.00

$13,393,050.00

$12,531,750.00

$12,531,750.00

Mosley Construction 1, LLC

$23,941,500.00

$23,941,500.00

$23,941,500.00

No Bid

LORIG CONSTRUCTION CO.

$34,155,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$34,155,000.00

Robe, Inc.

$12,936,000.00

$13,290,750.00

$12,936,000.00

$12,936,000.00

AGAE Contractors, Inc.

$16,838,250.00

$16,838,250.00

$16,838,250.00

$16,838,250.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY
2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 | TTY: 630.241.6988
www.illinoistollway.com
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Contract#/Description 21-0039R Overhead Door Parts and Repair Services

Due Date: Friday, August 19, 2021
Time: 10:30a.m. CDT

Builders Chicago Corporation $703,090.00
United Door and Dock LLC $648,700.00
Industrial Door Company $982,841.00

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.

Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations.

2700 Ogden Avenue | Downers Grove, IL 60515 | Phone: 630.241.6800 |TTY: 630.241.6988

ILLINOIS TOLLWAY

www.illinoistollway.com






