
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

 
 

Contract #21-0122R /Portable Wheel Load Weight Scales  

Due Date: May 4, 2022 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

F L Walz Inc. $233,160.00 

Focus Business Inc. $264,000.00 
 

 

 

 

 

 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description 20-0206RR Safety Appurtenance Parts: Guardrail, Cable, and Attenuator 
Parts – Group 1 

Due Date: 5/4/2022 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Cicero Mfg. & Supply Company, Inc.  $250,672.00 
 

 

 

 

 



Summary by Vendor and Location 
 

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB 

Contract 21-0217 Bulk Fuel 

Due Date: 5/4/2022 

Time: 10:30 a.m. 

 

As read at the bid opening: 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Christian County Farmers Supply Co. $35,549,496.92 

Petroleum Traders Corporation $36,269,075.29 

Gladieux Trading & Marketing Company, LP $40,327,668.80 

G. Cooper Oil Company, Inc. $32,981,258.36 

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc. $15,395,690.00 

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc. $40,454,545.02 

 

 

 



Summary by Vendor and Location 
 

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Christian 
County Farmers 
Supply Co. 

Locations 1 -17 - No totals provided by location on pricing page. 
 

Petroleum 
Traders 
Corporation 

Initial Term 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,796,301.64 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total: $990,191.04 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,799,904.06 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,537,015.81 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,395,383.06 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,265,523.81 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,075,572.67 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08)Total: $1,491,269.36 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11)Total: $1,030,922.61 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $954,812.19 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $554,648.24 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,217,122.04 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,210,466.05 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $803,330.00 
 

2-Year Renewal 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,798,531.65 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total : $991,416.05 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,802,134.07 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,538,880.82 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,397,108.07 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,267,078.82 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,076,887.68 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,493,114.37 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,032,187.62 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $955,972.20 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $555,333.25 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,219,872.05 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,211,966.06 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $804,330.00 



Summary by Vendor and Location 
 

Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Gladieux 
Trading & 
Marketing 
Company, LP 

Initial Term: 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,810,079.31 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total: $1,387,007.10 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,807,721.10 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,735,932.65 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $379,630.20 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,708,029.10 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,343,125.66 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,069,460.11 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,499,530.11 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,204,110.11 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: $119,213.79 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $1,129,554.98 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: $121,760.10 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $771,634.31 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $1,504,936.11 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,216,485.10 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $809,300.00 
 
2-Year Renewal 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,812,313.32 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total : $1,395,847.11 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,809,734.91 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,744,276.76 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $383,821.90 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,712,474.61 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,352,705.47 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,070,894.92 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,501,477.52 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,208,729.92 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: $120,280.37 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $1,133,443.00 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: $123,107.50 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $773,830.42 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,536,698.12 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,217,883.11 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $810,240.00 
 
 



Summary by Vendor and Location 
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

G. Cooper Oil 
Company, Inc. 

Initial Term: 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,809,062.098 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total: $1,373,203.098 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,812,249.112 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,708,248.68 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $360,838.55 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,699,313.113 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: No Bid 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: No Bid 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,500,330.612 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,200,938.627 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: No Bid 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $764,989.086 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,231,518.098 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,218,238.107 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $810,200.00 
 
2-Year Renewal 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,809,062.098 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total : $1,373,203.098 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,812,249.112 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,708,248.68 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $360,838.55 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,699,313.113 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: No Bid 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: No Bid 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,500,330.612 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,200,938.627 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: No Bid 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $764,989.086 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,231,518.098 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,218,238.107 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $810,200.00 
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Colonial Oil 
Industries, Inc. 

Initial Term: 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,081,925.00 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total: $371,826.00 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,083,303.00 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $499,524.00 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $372,501.00 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $583,000.00 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: No Bid 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $708,400.00 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: No Bid 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: No Bid 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $207,030.00 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $1,248,102.00 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $708,654.00 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $832,560.00 
 
2-Year Renewal 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,081,925.00 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total : $371,826.00 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,083,303.00 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $499,524.00 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $372,501.00 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $583,000.00 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: No Bid 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $708,400.00 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: No Bid 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: No Bid 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: No Bid 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $207,030.00 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $1,248,102.00 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $708,654.00 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $832,560.00 
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Vendor Name: Total Bid 

Mansfield Oil 
Company Of 
Gainesville, Inc. 

Initial Term: 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,811,309.46 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total: $1,369,725.56 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,811,309.46 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,707,797.73 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $355,295.01 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,696,706.59 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,272,210.23 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,081,018.58 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,510,132.03 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,210,853.75 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: $113,590.27 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $1,120,582.78 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: $113,669.01 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $764,396.04 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,244,135.10 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,225,180.91 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $818,460.00 
 
2-Year Renewal 
Location 1:  Maintenance Building #1 (M-01) Total: $1,811,309.46 
Location 2:  Maintenance Building #2 (M-02) Total : $1,369,725.56 
Location 3:  Maintenance Building #3 (M-03) Total: $1,811,309.46 
Location 4:  Maintenance Building #4 (M-04) Total: $1,707,797.73 
Location 5:  Edens Spur Salt Dome Total: $355,295.01 
Location 6:  Maintenance Building #5 (M-05) Total: $1,696,706.59 
Location 7:  Maintenance Building #6 (M-06) Total: $1,272,210.23 
Location 8:  Maintenance Building #7 (M-07) Total: $1,081,018.58 
Location 9:  Maintenance Building #8 (M-08) Total: $1,510,132.03 
Location 10:  Maintenance Building #11 (M-11) Total: $1,210,853.75 
Location 11:  Route 47 Salt Dome Total: $113,590.27 
Location 12:  Maintenance Building #12 (M-12) Total: $1,120,582.78 
Location 13:  Route 251 Salt Dome Total: $113,669.01 
Location 14:  Plaza 99 Total: $764,396.04 
Location 15:  Maintenance Building #14 (M-14) Total: $2,244,135.10 
Location 16:  Maintenance Building #16 (M-16) Total: $1,225,180.91 
Location 17:  Tollway Central Administration Building Total: $818,460.00 
 
 

 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

Contract#/Description 22-0036 Aluminum Sign Blanks 

Due Date: 5/11/2022 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

No Bids were received  
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Contract #/Description:  22-0047 / Recloseable Fasteners 

Due Date: May 18, 2022 

Time: 10:30 am, CDT 

 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

J. P. Simons & Company $227,800.00 

Caledonia, LLC $455,400.00 

Toner Vision, Inc. DBA ProVar 
Technologies  $407,600.00 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
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Contract#/Description 22-0038 Backflow Inspection and Repair Services 

Due Date: 5/25/2022 

Time: 10:30 a.m.  

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

   Fidelity Plumbing LLC  $576,220.00 

T & J Plumbing, Inc. $627,374.20 

                         Chicago Backflow, Inc. $558,215.00 

                         The Aberdeen Group, Inc. $696,433.77 
 

 

 

 

 

 


